
  September 13, 2016 
  Ruston, LA 
 
TO:  Lincoln Parish Police Jury 
 
FROM:  Finance Committee 
 
SUBJECT: Committee Report 
 
 The Finance Committee of the Lincoln Parish Police Jury met in the Police Jury Meeting Room, 
Third Floor, Lincoln Parish Courthouse, Tuesday, September 13, 2016, at 5:00 p.m.  Present were: Joseph 
Henderson; Chair, Hazel Hunter, Jody Backus, Skip Russell, and Annette Straughter.  
 
 ABSENT: None 
 
 Joe Henderson called the meeting to order and delivered the Invocation. 
 
 Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Hazel Hunter, to approve the agenda. The 
motion carried with the following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Hunter, Backus, Russell, Henderson and Staughter 
 
 NAYS:  None 
  
 The Committee received 2017 budget requests from the following Departments: 
 
Lincoln Total Community Action: Clotill Smith was present to request funding in the amount of 
$1,500.00, an increase of $1,000.00 over current annual funding.  
 
Bayou Lake D’Arbonne Commission: No request was received. Current funding is $1,800.00. 
 
Sparta Groundwater Commission:  No request was received. Current funding is $2,500.00. 
 
Department of Veterans Affairs: No request was received. Current funding is $5,000.00. 
 
Council on Aging: Michelle Wright was present to request a continuance of the current annual funding of 
$5,000.00.   
 
Coordinating and Development: A letter was received requesting funding of $10,721.00.  
 
IT Department: Jackson Matthews was present to request a continuance of the current annual funding 
in the amount of $14,000.00. 
 
Juvenile Assistance Program: A letter was received to request a continuance of the current annual 
funding in the amount of $15,278.00. 
 
LSU Cooperative Extension Service: Gary Stockton was present to request a continuance of the 
current annual funding in the amount of $16,000.00. 
 
Lincoln Parish Clerk of Court: No request was received. Current funding is $22,800.00. 
 
Registrar of Voters: Dianna Stone was present to request funding of $23,800.00, an increase of $426.00 
from current funding. 
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Lincoln Parish GIS: Jackson Matthews was present to request a continuance of the current annual 
funding in the amount of $25,000.00. 
 
Lincoln Parish Coroner: A letter was received requesting a continuance of the current annual funding in 
the amount of $57,683.00.  
 
Third Judicial District Court: Judge Tommy Rogers was present to request continued funding for the 
court reporters and that the Court Reporters be considered for the same percentage raise other parish 
employees may receive.  
 
Lincoln Parish District Attorney: John Belton was present to request a continuance of the current 
annual funding in the amount of the $244,660.00. 
 
Keep Lincoln Parish Beautiful: No request was received. Current funding is $7,500.00. 
 
Four Paws: No request was received. Current funding is $12,000.00. 
 
Northeast Delta Human Services Authority: Angela Williams was present to request a continuance of 
the current funding in the amount of $1,530.  
 
Lincoln Parish Health Unit: Lynell Washington was present to request continued funding in the amount 
of $18,500.00.  
 
 The Committee agreed to take the budget requests for the year 2017 under advisement. There 
being no other business to discuss, the meeting was adjourned. 
 
 
 
 
            
Courtney Hall       Joe Henderson 
Parish Administrator     Chair 
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  Ruston, LA 

TO:  Lincoln Parish Police Jury 
           
FROM:  Solid Waste and Recycling Committee 
           
SUBJECT: Committee Report 
 
          The Solid Waste and Recycling Committee of the Lincoln Parish Police Jury met in the Police 
Jury Meeting Room, Third Floor, Lincoln Parish Courthouse, September 13, 2016, at 6:00 p.m. 
Present were: Walter Pullen, Chair; Randy Roberson, David Hammons, Jody Backus, and Sharyon 
Mayfield. 
 
 ABSENT:   None 
 
 Walter Pullen called the meeting to order and delivered the invocation. 
 
 David Hammons offered a motion, seconded by Randy Roberson, to approve the Agenda. 
The motion carried with the following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus, and Mayfield  
 
 NAYS:  None 
 
 The first item on the Agenda was to discuss and take action, if necessary, on the 
consolidation of refuse container sites around the two future centralized sites located on Pleasant 
Grove Road and LA. Highway 507. Following discussion, David Hammons offered a motion, 
seconded by Randy Roberson, to consolidate the refuse container sites within an approximate three 
mile radius of each centralized site once construction is complete. The motion carried with the 
following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus, and Mayfield  
 
 NAYS:  None 
 
 Next on the agenda was to consider authorizing appraisals for centralized collection sites. 
David Hammons offered a motion, seconded by Randy Roberson, to authorize the appraisals.  
 
 YEAS:  Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus, and Mayfield  
 
 NAYS:  None 
 
 Under other business several Jurors pointed out current problematic sites within their 
districts. There being no other business to come before the Committee, the meeting was adjourned.  
 
 
 
              
Courtney Hall       Walter Pullen 
Parish Administrator      Committee Chair 



Public Works  September 13, 2016 
  Ruston, LA 

TO:  Lincoln Parish Police Jury 
           
FROM:  Public Works Committee 
           
SUBJECT: Committee Report 
 
          The Public Works Committee of the Lincoln Parish Police Jury met in the Police 
Jury Meeting Room, Third Floor, Lincoln Parish Courthouse, September 13, 2016, at 
6:30 p.m. Present were: Skip Russell, Chair; Bobby Bennett, David Hammons, Jody 
Backus, and Annette Straughter. 
 
 ABSENT:  None 
 
 Skip Russell called the meeting to order and delivered the invocation. 
 
 Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Bobby Bennett, to approve 
the Agenda. The motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Bennett, Hammons, Backus, Russell, and Straughter 
  
 NAYS:  None 
 
 First on the Agenda was to review the final plat for King’s Way Subdivision. The 
Parish Administrator reported that the plat was in compliance with Parish Ordinances. 
Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Bobby Bennett, to approve the final 
plat for King’s Way Subdivision. The motion was voted upon and carried with the 
following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Bennett, Hammons, Backus, Russell, and Straughter 
  
 NAYS:  None 
 
 Next on the Agenda was to review the final plat for Stable Run Subdivision. The 
Parish Administrator reported that the plat was in compliance with Parish Ordinances. 
Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Bobby Bennett, to approve the final 
plat for Stable Run Subdivision. The motion was voted upon and carried with the 
following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Bennett, Hammons, Backus, Russell, and Straughter 
  
 NAYS:  None 
 
 Bobby Bennett offered a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to assist the 
Simsboro School with installation of speed bumps and a crosswalk on Tiger Drive.  
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The motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 YEAS:  Bennett, Hammons, Backus, Russell, and Straughter 
  
 NAYS:  None 
 
 Under other business, Highway Superintendent Jerry Doss gave a brief report on 
current projects. There being no other business to come before the Committee, the 
meeting was adjourned.  
  
              
Courtney Hall       Skip Russell  
Parish Administrator      Committee Chair 
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 The Lincoln Parish Police Jury met in regular session on Tuesday, September 13, 
2016, at 7:00 p.m., at its regular meeting place in the Courthouse, Ruston, Louisiana.  
Present were: Theresa Wyatt, District One; Hazel D. Hunter, District Two; Bobby 
Bennett, District Three; Randy Roberson, District Four; David Hammons, District Five; 
Walter Pullen, District Six; Jody Backus; District Seven; Skip Russell, District Eight; Joe 
Henderson, District Nine; Nancy Wilson, District Ten; Sharyon Mayfield, District Eleven 
and Annette Straughter, District Twelve. 
 
 Absent: None 
 
 Mr. Jody Backus called the meeting to order and Randy Roberson delivered the 
invocation and led the Pledge of Allegiance. 
  
 Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Randy Roberson, to approve 
the Agenda as presented. The motion carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Mr. Backus called for any public comments on the agenda as approved. Mr. Bill 
Smith questioned the procedure for an individual to be placed on the Agenda. Dr. 
Augusta Clark was present to make comments about the library millage rate. 
 
 Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Hazel Hunter, to approve the 
minutes of the August 9, 2016 regular meeting. The motion carried with the following 
votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Mayor Ronny Walker was present to thank the Jury for providing a location for 
the recycling transfer station at the landfill. Mayor Walker indicated that the City of 
Ruston would begin collecting recyclables after January 1, 2017 and that this service, as 
well as door-to-door pickup of household refuse would be offered to parish residents 
within a three mile radius of Ruston.   
 
 Following a brief discussion of the outline of procedural requirements for 
conducting a Board of Review and holding the necessary public hearings for the 
property tax assessment process for the year 2016, Skip Russell made a motion, 
seconded by Annette Straughter, that the Police Jury recess the regular meeting and 
reconvene as the Property Assessment Board of Review for the year 2016.  The motion 
was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 President Backus explained the purpose of the public hearing as being to 
consider the complaints of qualified persons as provided by Louisiana Revised Statutes 
47:1992; and further, to make determinations as being necessary and proper relative to 
the assessment of real and personal property for the year 2016 in Lincoln Parish.   
 
 Joe Henderson made a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to begin the 
public hearing. The motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
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 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Thomas J. Cranford, Assessment Number 21198. 
 
 At this time, Parish Tax Assessor Sheila Bordelon was recognized.  Mrs. Bordelon 
explained the assessment of property owned by Mr. Cranford, and presented supporting 
information.   President Backus recognized Mr. Thomas J. Cranford, who presented 
objections to the assessment and evaluation of the property and presented reasons for 
the objection. 
 
 After comments and discussion in connection with the assessment review 
procedure, the Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely 
received from Mr. Don Pickard, Assessment Number 5664. Parish Assessor Sheila 
Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned 
by Mr. Pickard and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized Mr. 
Don Pickard, who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of the 
property and presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Mr. Mark Bartlett, Assessment Number 6967. Parish Assessor Sheila Bordelon was 
recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned by Mr. Bartlett 
and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized Mr. Mark Bartlett, 
who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of the property and 
presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Thomas and Nancy Smith, Assessment Number 30929. No one was present to 
present any oral comments regarding the assessment and evaluation. Parish Assessor 
Sheila Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property 
owned by Mr. and Mrs. Smith and presented supporting information.   
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Mr. Merton Elgin McFadden, Assessment Number 4579. Parish Assessor Sheila 
Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned 
by Mr. McFadden and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized 
Mr. Merton McFadden, who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of 
the property and presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Mark and Amy Taylor, Assessment Number 21112. Parish Assessor Sheila Bordelon 
was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned by Mr. and 
Mrs. Taylor and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized Mr. 
Taylor, who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of the property and 
presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Leon and Daphne Taylor, Assessment Number 25515. Parish Assessor Sheila 
Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned 
by Mr. and Mrs. Taylor and presented supporting information.  President Backus 
recognized Mrs. Taylor, who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of 
the property and presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Mr. Bryan K. Huffman, Assessment Number 13464. Parish Assessor Sheila 
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Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned 
by Mr. Huffman and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized 
Mr. Huffman, who presented objections to the assessment and evaluation of the 
property and presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from MGB Properties, Assessment Numbers 9522 and 36372. Parish Assessor Sheila 
Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of property owned 
by MGB Properties and presented supporting information.  President Backus recognized 
Mrs. Melisa Hanson, representing MGB Properties, who presented objections to the 
assessment and evaluation of the property and presented reasons for the objection. 
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Cushman and Wakefield, Assessment Numbers 100056 and 105793. No one was 
present to present any oral comments regarding the assessment and evaluation. Parish 
Assessor Sheila Bordelon was recognized. Mrs. Bordelon explained the assessment of 
properties represented by Cushman and Wakefield and presented supporting 
information.   
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from KE Andrews, Assessment Numbers 1503, 34850, 1897, 1898, and 3596. Assessor 
Bordelon introduced Ms. Barbie Weatherford, Commercial Property Specialist, to provide 
comments concerning these assessments. No one from KE Andrews was present to 
present any oral comments regarding the assessment and evaluation.  
 
 The Board was advised that an official protest letter had been timely received 
from Marvin Poer and Company, Assessment Numbers 1030, 1816, 1817, 30372, 2434, 
30654, and 34070. Ms. Weatherford explained the assessment of properties 
represented by Marvin Poer and Company and presented supporting information. No 
one from Marvin Poer and Company was present to present any oral comments 
regarding the assessment and evaluation.   
 
 There being no further appeals or input for the Board of Review to consider, a 
roll call vote was taken on each property with the following results:  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 21198: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson   XX    
David Hammons   XX    
Walter Pullen   XX    
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell   XX    
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX      

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in six Yeas and six Nays. The Assessment was upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 5664: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
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Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen   XX    
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX      

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in nine Yeas and three Nays. The Assessment was 
upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 6967: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen   XX    
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell   XX    
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX      

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in nine Yeas and three Nays. The Assessment was 
upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 30929: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons   XX    
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter     XX 

  
 The Roll Call vote resulted in eight Yeas and three Nays and one Abstention. The 
Assessment was upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 4579: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
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Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in ten Yeas and two Nays. The Assessment was 
upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 21112: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett   XX    
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons   XX    
Walter Pullen   XX    
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell   XX    
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in six Yeas and six Nays. The Assessment was upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 25515: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett   XX    
Randy Roberson   XX    
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in eight Yeas and four Nays. The Assessment was 
upheld. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 13464: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
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Bobby Bennett   XX    
Randy Roberson   XX    
David Hammons   XX    
Walter Pullen   XX    
Jody Backus   XX    
Skip Russell   XX    
Joe Henderson   XX    
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield   XX    
Annette Straughter   XX  

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in three Yeas and nine Nays. The Assessment was 
overturned. 
 
 Walter Pullen offered a motion, seconded by Sharyon Mayfield, to reset the 
Assessor’s assessment value for Assessment Number 13464 at $200,000.00. Following 
discussion, the motion carried with the following roll call votes:  
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell   XX    
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The Roll Call vote resulted in ten Yeas and two Nays. Assessment Number 13464 
was set at $200,000.00. 
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 9522: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote resulted in eleven Yeas and one Nay. The Assessment was 
upheld.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 100056: 
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MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 105793: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 36372: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote resulted in eleven Yeas and one Nay. The Assessment was 
upheld.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1503: 
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MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 34850: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1897: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1898: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
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Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 3596: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1030: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1816: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
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Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 1817: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 30372: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson   XX    
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote resulted in eleven yeas and one nay. The assessment was 
upheld.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 2434: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
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David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 30654: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 To uphold the assessment of number 34070: 
 
MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Annette Straughter XX    

 
 The roll call vote was unanimous to uphold the Assessment.  
 
 There being no further assessment appeals for consideration, Annette Straughter 
made a motion, seconded by David Hammons, to certify the assessment list to the 
Louisiana Tax Commission. The motion was voted upon and carried with the following 
votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  Wilson  
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 David Hammons offered a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to adjourn 
the Board of Review and reconvene the Police Jury. The motion was voted upon and 
carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Travis Napper was present to present the Ruston-Lincoln Convention and 
Visitor’s Bureau 2016 Amended/2017 Proposed Budget. Skip Russell offered a motion, 
seconded by Annette Straughter, to approve the 2016 Amended Budget for the Ruston-
Lincoln Convention and Visitor’s Bureau. The motion was voted upon and carried with 
the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Skip Russell offered a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to approve the 
2017 Proposed Budget for the Ruston-Lincoln Convention and Visitor’s Bureau. The 
motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Theresa Wyatt offered a motion, seconded by Sharyon Mayfield, to adopt an 
ordinance amending and levying the tax millage rate for the purpose of operating, 
maintaining, constructing and supporting a public library and it’s branches in Lincoln 
Parish, Louisiana from 4.62 Mills to 3.5 Mills.  
 

ORDINANCE NO. 354-16-(0) 
 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AND LEVYING TAX MILLAGE RATE FOR REVENUE FOR 
EXPENSES OF THE LINCOLN PARISH POLICE JURY FOR THE YEAR 2016. 
 

SECTION I. BE IT ORDAINED by the Lincoln Parish Police Jury in regular session 
convened, this 13th day of September 2016, which meeting was conducted in 
accordance with the Open Meetings Law and the additional requirements of Article VII, 
Section 23(C) of the Louisiana Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B), that the following 
amended millage rate be and is hereby levied upon the dollar of the assessed valuation 
of all property subject to ad valorem taxation within said Parish for the year 2016, for 
the purpose of raising revenue: 

 
a. For the purpose of operating, maintaining, constructing, and supporting a public 

library and its branches in Lincoln Parish, Louisiana .……….…..…… (3.50) MILLS 
 
SECTION II. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that the Assessor of Lincoln Parish, 

Louisiana, be and he/she is hereby directed to extend the above levies of taxes on the 
tax rolls of Lincoln Parish, Louisiana, for the year 2016. 

 
The foregoing ordinance was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption 

thereof, and the ordinance was adopted by the following votes: 
 

MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
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Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett   XX    
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Ronny Walker XX      

 
        

/s/ Jody Backus    
        Jody Backus 
        Parish President 
 
 Randy Roberson offered a motion, seconded by Joe Henderson, to adopt an 
ordinance establishing and levying tax millage rate the purpose of constructing, 
improving, and acquiring equipment and furniture for the public library in Lincoln Parish, 
Louisiana (Bond Millage) at 0.80 mills.  
 

ORDINANCE NO. 355-16-(0) 
 
AN ORDINANCE LEVYING TAX MILLAGE RATE FOR REVENUE FOR EXPENSES OF THE 
LINCOLN PARISH POLICE JURY FOR THE YEAR 2016. 
 

SECTION I. BE IT ORDAINED by the Lincoln Parish Police Jury in regular session 
convened, this 13th day of September 2016, which meeting was conducted in 
accordance with the Open Meetings Law and the additional requirements of Article VII, 
Section 23(C) of the Louisiana Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B), that the following 
amended millage rate be and is hereby levied upon the dollar of the assessed valuation 
of all property subject to ad valorem taxation within said Parish for the year 2016, for 
the purpose of raising revenue: 

 
b. For the purpose of constructing, improving, and acquiring equipment and 

furniture for the public library in Lincoln Parish, Louisiana …..…… (0.80) MILLS 
 
SECTION II. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that the Assessor of Lincoln Parish, 

Louisiana, be and he/she is hereby directed to extend the above levies of taxes on the 
tax rolls of Lincoln Parish, Louisiana, for the year 2016. 

 
The foregoing ordinance was read in full, the roll was called on the adoption 

thereof, and the ordinance was adopted by the following votes: 
 

MEMBER YEA NAY ABSENT ABSTAINED 
Theresa Wyatt XX      
Hazel Hunter XX      
Bobby Bennett XX      
Randy Roberson XX      
David Hammons XX      
Walter Pullen XX      
Jody Backus XX      
Skip Russell XX      
Joe Henderson XX      
Nancy Wilson XX      
Sharyon Mayfield XX      
Ronny Walker XX      
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/s/ Jody Backus    
        Jody Backus 
        Parish President 
 
 Next on the agenda was to take action on bids for surplus property. Annette 
Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Randy Roberson, to award each bid to the 
high bidder.  
 

Lincoln Parish Police Jury 
September 1, 2016 
Surplus Property 

ITEM 1. 2008 Ford 12 Passenger Van - $2,500.00   

Bidder Bid Price 
NO BID 

ITEM 2.  2008 Ford 12 Passenger Van - $2,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 3.  1999 Ford 15 Passenger Van - $600.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 4.  2004 Dodge Ram 2500 Truck - $1,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Rusty Owens $1,250.00  

ITEM 5.  1996 Dodge 3500 Truck - $500.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 6.  2011 International 7400 - $25,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $25,300.00  

ITEM 7.  6' Hercules Cutter - $300.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $535.00  
Zeb Ginn $458.00  

Johnnie Dyes $429.50  

ITEM 8.  2001 Ford F-250 Truck - $500.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Earnest Anchie $900.00  

ITEM 9.  Van Dorn Valve Grinder - $250.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Larry Caldwell $275.00  

ITEM 10.  1990 Ford 5900 Tractor - $3,500.00 
Bidder Bid Price 
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Zeb Ginn $3,856.00  

Rusty Owens $3,785.00  

ITEM 11. 2008 New Holland TT60A Tractor - $5,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Zeb Ginn $5,362.00  
Rusty Owens $5,130.00  

ITEM 12.  2010 New Holland Tractor - $5,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $6,300.00  
Zeb Ginn $6,270.00  

Rusty Owens $5,495.00  

ITEM 13.  Holtzer-Cabot Van Norman Boring Bar - $100.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

William Harper $200.00  
Larry Coldwell $125.00  

ITEM 14.  1996 Dodge 3500 Pickup Truck - $1,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Rusty Owens $1,250.00  

ITEM 15.  1991 Kubota Tractor - $1,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Rusty Owens $1,285.00  
Donald Plunk $1,100.00  

ITEM 16.  1990 Troy Built Tiller - $150.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $265.00  
Zeb Ginn $175.60  

Frederick Brooks $161.50  

ITEM 17.  Bush Hog - $150.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 18.  Bush Hog - $150.00  
Bidder Bid Price 

Danny Willis $375.00  

ITEM 19.  Woods Finish Mower - $300.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 20.  Kubota Catch all bagger - $100.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $100.00  

ITEM 21.  1980 Case 580C Backhoe - $5,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 
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ITEM 22.  2001 International 4700 Truck with loader - $7,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $8,750.00  
Josh McKay $8,368.00  

ITEM 23.  2003 Ford E-350 Super Duty - $800.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 24.  Caterpillar M-D7G - $25,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 25.  1983 Caterpillar Motor Grader - $45,000.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

NO BID 

ITEM 26.  1998 Fairbanks Scales - $500.00 
Bidder Bid Price 

Donald Plunk $2,000.00  
 
 The motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Annette Straughter offered a motion, seconded by Jody Backus, to authorize the 
Administrator to execute an agreement with the City of Ruston for access to 
adjudicated property parcel no. 25183000138 for activities associated with Martin 
Luther King Drive Extension Project. The motion was voted upon and carried with the 
following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Jody Backus announced upcoming board and commission vacancies for Greater 
Ward One Waterworks District, Waterworks District No. 1, Waterworks District No. 3, 
Fire Protection District Commission, and the Northeast Delta Human Services Authority. 
No action was taken. 
 
 Ms. Laura Hartt, Parish Treasurer, gave a brief report on parish finances. Hazel 
Hunter offered a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to accept the report. The 
motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Joe Henderson state that the Finance Committee met at 5:00 pm this day to 
receive requests for 2017 funding and that no action was taken. Mr. Henderson offered 
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a motion, seconded by Annette Straughter, to approve the minutes of the Finance 
Committee. The motion was voted upon and carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Walter Pullen stated that the Solid Waste and Recycling Committee met at 6:00 
pm this day and the Committee recommends:  

1. Allowing the relocation and/or consolidation within a three mile radius of the 
planned Centralized Collection Sites.  

2. Allowing the Administrator to seek appraisals on additional properties to be 
used for Centralized Collection Sites.  

 
 Walter Pullen offered a motion, seconded by David Hammons to approve the 
minutes of the Solid Waste and Recycling Committee. The motion was voted upon and 
carried with the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Skip Russell stated that the Public Works Committee met at 6:30 pm this day and 
the Committee recommends:  
 

1. Approving the Final Plat for King’s Way Subdivision. 
2. Approving the Final Plat for Stable Run Subdivision. 
3. Authorizing assistance for Simsboro School installing speed bumps on Tiger 

Drive, contingent on Highway Department schedule.  
 
 Skip Russell offered a motion, seconded by David Hammons, to approve the 
minutes of the Public Works Committee. The motion was voted upon and carried with 
the following votes: 
 
 Yeas:  Wyatt, Hunter, Bennett, Roberson, Hammons, Pullen, Backus,  
   Russell, Henderson, Wilson, Mayfield and Straughter 
 
 Nays:  None 
 
 Walter Pullen reminded everyone about the upcoming tax millage renewal 
election for road construction and maintenance.  
 
 Under Public Comments, Bill Smith expressed his opinion about the spending of 
public funds. There being no other business to come before the Jury, the meeting was 
adjourned.  
 
 
 
 
              
Courtney Hall       Jody Backus 
Parish Administrator      Parish President 
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